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GRAND KNIGHT’S MESSAGE 

Want to keep up with current events of our Council? 
Be sure to visit our website for updated information. 

 

Our website is: 
 

http://www.kofc5714.org 
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Fernando Linka 
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Timothy Ewing 
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John Acker, Jr., PGK 
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Robert Tartaglia, PGK 
 
William Cote, GK 
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Hello Brother Knights, 
 

I would like to thank our Deputy Grand Knight, Bob 
Tartaglia, for his help with our beef and beer event and 
all those who contributed to help make it a success. 
 

We have our Elvis show coming up on December 7th, 
please do not forget about that. Anyone who wants to 
attend get your tickets now. 
 

All those who wish to get involved in a event or have an 
idea for one please bring it up at a meeting so we can all 
get involved. 
 

I would like to take this opportunity to congratulate 
Dave Adams, he has been nominated Knight of the 
Month. Dave is a Knight who can be counted on to help 
out at most events, Thank you Dave! 
 

As a reminder we have our Christmas party on the 15th 
and our New Year’s Eve party on the 31st. Now would 
be a great time to hear your input on these events. 
 

If you know anyone who would like to become a knight 
bring Him to the hall and introduce us. 
 

I would like to wish everyone a Merry Christmas and 
Happy New Year. 
 

Pete Cote, GK 
pcotewp@aol.com or 856-305-2487 



The following Council members will be celebrating their 

birthday during this month. Happy Birthday from all the 

members of Council 5714. 

FRATERNAL ACTIVITIES 

If you know of any Knight or family member that is ei-

ther sick or in distress and needs prayers or any other 

assistance, please email navigator5714@gmail.com or 

have someone do so for you if you do not have email. 

SICK LIST 

Jack Acker, Jr. 

Deacon Joe Card 

Sam Cerasi 

Jack Ehmann 

Anthony Martino 

John Obuchowski 

Pete Ranjo, Sr. 

DECEMBER BIRTHDAYS 

Hugh McNulty 

Deacon Ronald Meyers 

James Murzello 

Christian Obuchowski 

Edward Reed 

Sean Turzanski 

FOURTH DEGREE NEWS 

Change of Contact Information? 

Have you recently moved or changed your email address 

or phone number but would like to continue to receive 

updates about our Council? You may email any updated 

contact information to navigator5714@gmail.com or 

contact me at the information listed below and I will 

make sure to get your information up to date. 

Brian Kohler, PGK 
bdkohler@comcast.net or 856-979-9462 

Fourth Degree Business Meeting 

Instead of our regular monthly meeting the John Tatham 
Assembly will host our annual Advent Party. The party 
will be at our Council Home starting with a cocktail 
hour at 6:30 PM, dinner at 7:30 and dancing and socializ-
ing after dinner. Anyone who is planning on attending, 
please look for the reservation form in the next newslet-
ter or you can find it on our website at; 
 

www.johntathamassembly648.org 
 

 If you have a problem getting the form that way, please 
contact me at 609-560-1209 and I will be able to provide 
you with a copy. Everyone attending must register. The 
cost of the dinner is $30.00 per person and guests are 
welcome. The dress code for members is tux with social 
baldric or a dark suite. Guests should wear a dark suit. 
Women should wear a cocktail dress or evening gown. 
 

Please get your reservation form into Faithful Captain 
Joe Daverso by Sunday Dec. 1st. His address is at the 
bottom of the form.    
 

Jim Berg, Faithful Comptroller 
iceberg5555@comcast.net or 609-560-1209 

The Navigator is published monthly by Our Lady  
of Perpetual Help Council 5714, Maple Shade, NJ. 
Articles for publication should be emailed no 
later than the 15th day of each month to: 

 navigator5714@gmail.com 

Please report any errors or corrections to: 

navigator5714@gmail.com 

Richard DiDonato 

John Hillard, Jr. 

Christopher Houck 

John Kauppinen 

Nicholas Kaz 

Joseph Lynch, Jr. 

Joseph Matthews 

Council Event Updates 

Worthy Brothers...I want to thank those Brothers who 
sold tickets for and attended the Beef and Beer in Octo-
ber. There were not many people who came (a little 
over 40) but those who did had a good time. We did 
make a nice profit because in addition to ticket sales 
there were some wonderful donations to the event. 
 

Coming up this month in addition to Christmas with El-
vis starring Mark Reno is our annual New Year’s Eve 
party, one of our major fundraisers. We need to step up 
to the plate and sell tickets for the party. I am asking all 
of my Brothers to help out in selling tickets so the New 
Year’s party will be successful!!! See or call me or Car-
men Argentina for tickets and info....the cost this year 
will remain $ 65.00 per person. 
 

I hope all of you and yours will have a Holy and Merry 
Christmas and a healthy, prosperous and Happy 2019. 
 

God Bless, 
 

Bob Tartaglia, PGK 
rtartaglia740@gmail.com or 609-410-0424 



Day  Event         Time 
 

   2  Advent Begins 

   4  Officers Meeting @ The Maple Room     7:30 PM 

   8  Immaculate Conception 

 10  Home Association Meeting @ The Maple Room    7:30 PM 

 11  Business Meeting @ The Maple Room     7:30 PM (7:10 PM Rosary) 

 12  Fourth Degree Advent Party @ The Maple Room   6:30 PM 

 15  Council Christmas Party @ The Maple Room    7:00 PM 

 18  Social Night @ The Maple Room     7:00 PM 

 19  Surge for Service Meeting @ The Maple Room    7:30 PM 

 24  Christmas Eve 

 25  Christmas Day 

 31  New Year’s Eve 

 31  Council New Year’s Eve Party @ The Maple Room   8:00 PM 
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